
TENDER FOR MULTIPURPOSE LOUNGE FIT-OUT WORKS AT BANGUNAN AICB 
APPENDIX C - Declaration of Compliance with ABC Policy  

DECLARATION OF COMPLIANCE 
WITH ANTI-BRIBERY AND CORRUPTION POLICY 

 

From (Tenderer) :  

To : STF Resources Sdn Bhd 

Attention : Tender Secretariat 

Email Address : tender@stfresources.com 

Tender Procurement : Multipurpose Lounge Fit-Out Works at Bangunan AICB 

 
 
Dear Sir/Madam, 
 
We hereby declare that we are aware of the provisions of the Malaysian Anti-Corruption 
Commission Act 2009 and any other applicable anti-corruption law in which they operate 
their respective business (‘Applicable Anti-Corruption Laws’), and have not, directly or 
indirectly, violated any Applicable Anti-Corruption Law. We shall observe and comply with 
the provisions of the Applicable Anti-Corruption Law and all rules, regulations and 
guidelines made pursuant thereto. 
 
Without limitation of the generality of the foregoing, neither we any of our respective 
officers, employees, or agents: 
 
(a) has made or will make, directly or indirectly, any payment, loan or gift (or any offer, 
promise or authorization of any such payment, loan or gift), of any money or anything of 
value to or for the use of any government official under circumstances in which any of them 
knows or has reason to know that all or any portion of such money or thing of value has 
been or will be offered, given or promised, directly or indirectly, to any government official, 
for the purpose of inducing the government official to do any act or make any decision in 
his/her official capacity (including a decision to fail to perform his/her/its official function) or 
use his/her/its influence with a government or instrumentality thereof in order to affect any 
act or decision of such government or instrumentality or to assist the Party in obtaining or 
retaining any business;  

 
(b) has made or will make, directly or indirectly, any payment, loan or gift (or any offer, 
promise or authorization of any such payment, loan or gift), of any money or anything of 
value to or for the use of any employee, agent, or representative of another company, or to 
any other person, under circumstances in which any of them knows or has reason to know 
that all or any portion of such money or thing of value has been or will be offered, given or 
promised, directly or indirectly, for the purpose of inducing or rewarding the improper 
performance of any public function or business activity;  
 
(c) has received or will agree to receive, directly or indirectly, any payment, loan or gift (or 
any offer or promise of any such payment, loan, or gift), of any money or anything of value 
as an inducement or reward for the improper performance of any public function or business 
activity; or 
 
(d) has done or will do anything which would be considered an offence of giving or 
receiving or abetting the giving and/or receiving of gratification under any Applicable Anti-
Corruption Law.  
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Company Name 
 

Authorised Representative   

Designation  

Signature  

Date  

Company Stamp  

 

 


